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September 25, 2022


Rear Admiral Brad Rosen

Commander, Navy Region Southwest

Naval Base San Diego

750 Pacific Highway

San Diego, CA 92132


Re: Alliance building with Japan to defend California as its own nation.  You vile, arrogant 
thieving mother fuckers.  Torres and Austin are leaving your asses hanging in the breeze by the 
pole of the flag you defile.


Admiral Rosen,


The perversion you built your career upon is a blasphemy against all that is Holy.  Regardless of 
this letter finding its way under your "illustrious" nose -- undoubtedly a team of abortion stool 
warming civilian and enslaved, forced to be trash, enlisted shield you from a great many realities 
enabling your sleep each night blind to the consequences of your corruption -- you, with your 
chain of coconspirators are going to experience the full and complete rewards you are due.


You had marines to throw in the sacrifice mill as offerings and you abused these too.  What is 
worse, these marines are populated from the orphans of society sentenced into MCRD if they are 
one of the fortunate ones.  I Am the only qualified sacrificer to the Heavens, and civilian blood 
needs to hit the soil in retribution.


You mother fucking traitor.  Japan is going to swallow you up in the Pacific and merge with 
China and the Koreas after their dish of revenge is complete.  You have known this since May of 
2019 and you still insisted on moving forward with building alliances, lining your coffers, and 
corrupting youth.  We at Team God Hate you Rosen.  As that is the case, the Lord -- who loves 
you -- under Jehovah's mighty hand is delivering the discipline you are long over due.


You may not create a nation out of the state of California.  Even after its landscape is sculpted to 
form a double coast the island will belong to the North American continent, God Almighty, as 
does the Channel Islands.


What you can begin doing is readying yourself for My presence, once again, in San Diego.  You 
also need to be ready to defend all of North America from nuclear attack consequences Putin 
sends against South America and Mexico in retribution for the traitors of Russia who flee his draft 
orders.


Damn you, your treason you mother fucking filth and your promotion of buggery!  Get rid of that 
leach bundle of civilian trash over loading the Pacific office payroll and resources.  You need 
those funds for warfare, now!  Blow Torres a kiss for Me.


H.Q. USMC
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Pass out the Depends among the amphibious base command.  Grayson already has his.  Avoid air 
travel.  Keep Air Force One out of the sky to protect Biden.  The enjamb is My way of bestowing 
words of blessing with this letter as bonus content.  Rosen, none in your office need worry about 
serving alongside Me.  None of them need a Depend.  None at NASCC needed a Depend as well.


Mahalo,


mac Dukes PhD

the Christ

Lieutenant General USMC Special Forces


Distribution List: Milley, Berger, Gilday, Brown Jr, and McConville at the Pentagon
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